SALE RESULTS LIST BY SESSION
2007 Quarter Horse Yearling

9/20/2007 - 9/22/2007

SESSION ONE /Yearling

Hip # Horse (Sex & Birth Year) / Sire-Dam / [Covering Sire] Buyer State Price

1 Our Boy Jessie (C 06) No Bid $0
Mr Jess Perry-Kashmere Dash

2 Sixes Sign (C 06) Abelino Rojas TX $8,000
Streakin Sixes-Katies Sign

3 Paytons Hawk (C 06) Jose Rodriguez MEX $4,300
Hawkinson-Kels Sixieme Jeter

4 Eye Kiss For Cash (F 06) Terry C. or Mary Louise Pursel KS $7,500
Mr Eye Opener-Kiss A Dash

5 Queen Corona Bee (F 06) Raymundo Gonzalez X $4,200
Coronas Prospect-Kiss De Girl

6 Smart Fly (F 06) Lincoln Sherwood AZ $6,000
First Smart Money-Kiss On The Fly

7 Sydnies Dreamer (F 06) Repurchase $5,000
Streak And Dash-Kittys Gambler

8 Kool Cade (C 06) Clarence Scharbauer, Jr. TX $27,000
Hawkinson-Kool Kue Chick

9 KR Three Fires (C 06) Santana Garza TX $4,000
Tres Seis-KR Wildfire

10 Kuger (G 06) Tom Lyons, Inc. TX $4,500
Leaving Memories-Krishnas Winner

11 La Corona Gal (F 06) Carol Robertson CAN $4,000
Southern Corona-La Macya

12 Hawkinsong (F 06) Ramon Martinez Mexic $4,500
Hawkinson-Lady Cantada

13 BP A Lady Loves Cash (F 06) Repurchase $5,200
Southern Cartel-Lady Cash Oak

14 Antonio Gates (C 06) Repurchase $20,000
Hawkinson-Lady Gates Again

15 LaJolla Ladies Man (C 06) Repurchase $13,000
Streakin La Jolla-Lady Mara

16 SR Achilles (G 06) Repurchase $4,500
Apollo (TB)-Lady Of Olene

17 Laicos Lad (C 06) Pedro Rodriguez TX $6,000
Separatist-Laicos Dash

18 Racing Rezooms (C 06) Repurchase $27,500
Shazoom-Laleli

19 Kittyhawkish (C 06) Repurchase $7,000
Hawkish-Long Gone Kitty

20 Divas Dash (F 06) Steve & Kati Neal KS $15,000

Dash Ta Fame-Leading Diva
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21 Call Her Dee (F 06) Rick Miller OK $4,200
Deefirst-Leave Her Memories

22 Lethal Zoom (C 06) Edilberto Estrada NM $19,500
Shazoom-Lett Her Sign

23 Fishing With Libby (C 06) Salvador Pimienta, Agent AZ $34,000
Fishers Dash-Libbys Cartel

24 Cinnamon Dolce (F 06) Repurchase $10,000
Special Leader-Like Clockwork

25 RK First Kid (C 06) Santana Garza TX $2,000
Sweet First Down-Liked Kid

26 Good Luvin (F 06) Eleazar Martinez TX $12,500
Separatist-Lil Bit Strawfly

27 Take Off Mamie (F 06) Michael J. Rogers X $14,000
Take Off Jess-Lil Diamond Casey

28 Lilly Is Leaving (F 06) Javier Lara KS $4,700
Leaving Memories-Lillys Repo

29 Inclination Leader (C 06) Ruben Jake Garcia TX $5,500
Special Leader-Lindas Inclination

30 Lipstick Chick (F 06) Oscar Thomas MEX $7,200
Chicks Regard-Lipstick Kiss

31 Smokin Warrior (C 06) Rogelio Chavhrria Barrera X $13,500
Sweet First Down-Lisabetta

32 Corona Esparanza (F 06) Jose Martinez X $2,200
Cartel Dancer-Little Esparanza

33 Zoomin Alive (C 06) Jose Luis Ozuna TX $9,500
Shazoom-Live Performance

34 Hawk Talk (G 06) Repurchase $6,500
Hawkinson-LK Classy Perk

35 Smarty Jess Jones (C 06) Salvador Pimienta, Agent AZ $19,000
Feature Mr Jess-Lodi Lou

36 Furrtastic (C 06) Repurchase $5,000
Takin On The Cash-Long Gone Kitty

37 Look Im Open (C 06) Withdrawn
Mr Eye Opener-Lookin For Me

38 Feature This Dame (F 06) Salvador Pimienta, Agent AZ $20,000
Feature Mr Jess-Looks Like A Dame

39 Lost Creek Feature (C 06) Ramiro Villarreal, Agent MEX $25,500
Feature Mr Jess-Lost Creek Babe

40 A Lota Celab (C 06) Hector Estrada OK $5,000

Celeb-Lota Marie
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41 Unexpected Royalty (C 06) Double T Ranch OK $6,500
Royal Quick Dash-Lovasix

42 Skyline Lover (C 06) Repurchase $25,000
Feature Mr Jess-Loves That Gold

43 Leading Mo Cuishla (F 06) Withdrawn
Special Leader-Lovin Lib

44 Captan Starlight (C 06) Repurchase $12,000
Special Leader-Lucifer In Starlight

45 Okey Dokey Lucy (F 06) Withdrawn
Okey Dokey Dale-Lucy T

46 Money Smart Gal (F 06) Shearer Racing NM $8,000
First Smart Money-Lynns Allante

47 Celab Lyon Eyes (C 06) Tom Denham OK $5,000
Celeb-Lyon Eyes

48 Viognier (F 06) Humberto Perez Morales MEX $15,000
A Regal Choice-Lady Gates Again

49 Soaringwitheagles (C 06) Dub Seely OK $9,000
Sweet First Down-Lisabetta

50 Azoomadre (F 06) Repurchase $17,000
Azoom-Make It All Mine

51 Shoot Me The Cash (G 06) Repurchase $5,000
Shoot No-Mamas Shakin

52 Sixes Battleship (C 06) Double Eagle Ranch NM $21,000
Brimmerton-Mame Smashed

53 Eyesa Pie (C 06) David Meridyth X $3,500
Eyesa Special-Mas Raisen Pie

54 Cartel Account (C 06) Ramon A Valencia AZ $2,200
Cartel Dancer-May Account

55 My Southern Chick (F 06) Jose Rodriguez X $14,500
Southern Cartel-My Ladys Alibi

56 Chief Shazoom (F 06) Salvador Pimienta, Agent AZ $12,000
Shazoom-Meddlin Mischief

57 Merry Okey (F 06) Efren Garcia MEX $18,500
Okey Dokey Dale-Merry Winner

58 Eyem Lizzy Legal (F 06) Repurchase $21,000
Mr Eye Opener-Mightily Smashed

59 Eyesa Uno (C 06) Christine A. Hovey IA $18,000
Eyesa Special-Mighty Uno

60 Bac Fire (C 06) David L. Martinez X $4,200

Splash Bac-Mini Effort
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61 Never Ending Dale (C 06) Nancy Solis KY $4,000
Okey Dokey Dale-Minnie Meek

62 Eyesa Illusion (F 06) Jose R Espinoza X $4,900
Eyesa Special-Mirrors N Images

63 Eyesahappygirl (F 06) Ruben Jake Garcia X $5,500
Mr Eye Opener-Mirthful

64 Strawfly Jones (F 06) Rusty Patterson X $1,500
Fit To Fly-Miss Bar Juliet

65 Bernys Takin Thecash (F 06) Repurchase $4,000
Takin On The Cash-Miss Burna Boone

66 Cassy Stone (F 06) Nancy Solis KY $4,000
SC Chiseled In Stone-Miss Classy Snow

67 Jess A Cookie (F 06) Juniors Quarter Horses, Inc. CcO $21,500
Feature Mr Jess-Miss Cookie Bugs

68 Katdodash (C 06) Alejandro Garza TX $10,000
First To Shine-Miss Dashin Kate

69 Corona Attitude (F 06) Withdrawn
The Corona-Miss Desert Chrome

70 Zoom Diamond Runner (C 06) Armando Cortez X $7,500
Shazoom-Miss Diamond Runner

71 Chiseled By Hand (G 06) Billy Buchholz ND $3,700
SC Chiseled In Stone-Miss Easy Hand

72 Eye Miss Shazoom (F 06) Humberto Perez Morales MEX $10,000
Shazoom-Miss Eye Paint

73 Miss Cartel Elite (F 06) Withdrawn
Corona Cartel-Miss Fleet Elite

74 Miss Splash Of Fast (F 06) Julio Cesar de Hoyos X $7,500
Willie Wicked-Miss Hightime Jewel

75 Brimmertons Best (C 06) LM Racing Stables OK $17,000
Brimmerton-Miss Jetaroid

76 Proper Stone (F 06) Nadia Marcoux CAN $2,200
SC Chiseled In Stone-Miss Proper Ice

77 Miss Celab Dash (F 06) Juan Lara Fuentes MEX $4,000
Celeb-Miss Rebs Dash

78 Blue Wind Blew (F 06) J B or Sherrie Morace X $5,700
Spanish Boot-Miss Rocket Wind

79 Bullys Streaker (C 06) J. Allen Hale WYy $2,200
Bully Bullion-Miss Streakin Easy

80 Araminte (F 06) Gerardo Nunez NM $3,000

Dash Thru Traffic-Miss Super De Dash
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81 The Vig (C 06) Withdrawn
Corona Cartel-Miss Wicked

82 Wanta Be Free (F 06) Jose R Espinoza X $7,500
Spanish Boot-Miss Willie Nilly

83 Ms B Haven (F 06) Repurchase $30,000
Okey Dokey Dale-Miss Windy Bull

84 Deliver Me A Rose (F 06) William T. Ruffin TN $2,700
Heza Fast Man-Missys Mito Dancer

85 Reboot (C 06) Evaristo Adan TX $10,500
Spanish Boot-Mito Kiss

86 Streekin Jet (C 06) Jose Antonio Sole MEX $2,600
Biduino-Mixin Sixin

87 Hot N Flyin (C 06) Patty Wellmon WI $4,000
Fit To Fly-Miz Hotshot Gal

88 Chivato High (F 06) Luis G. Lopez X $2,100
Dash To Chivato-Money Makes A High

89 Moovin Apollo (F 06) Jose Antonio Sole MEX $3,200
Apollo (TB)-Moo Vin Rocky

90 Tommy Joad (C 06) Tom Denham OK $5,000
Okey Dokey Dale-Moon Done Gone

91 Sixes Quick Dash (F 06) Sergio Guerrero X $4,100
Royal Quick Dash-Ms Bubba

92 Cash For Coronas (F 06) Dream Chaser Farm CAN $2,500
Coronas Prospect-Ms Exclusive Cash

93 Oknaha (F 06) Withdrawn
Quick Coverage-Ms Luckie Class

94 Buttons N Beaus (F 06) Graciela Cabanas MEX $2,500
Alabama Schoolboy-Ms Pitti Patti

95 Dancing Seis (F 06) Withdrawn
Tres Seis-Ms Traffic Dancer

96 Kas Forspeed (F 06) J. W. Owens/Jose Maldonado X $3,000
Super De Kas-Ms Wind Fling

97 Taken On The Rose (F 06) Repurchase $5,500
Takin On The Cash-My All American Rose

98 First You Runaway (F 06) LM Racing Stables OK $17,000
First Down Dash-My Babys A Runaway

99 Southern Lady (F 06) Ramon Martinez Mexic $20,000
Southern Cartel-My Ladys Alibi

100 Hawk The Ranch (C 06) Repurchase $5,000

Hawkinson-My Native Sis
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101 Illusion Breeze (F 06) Repurchase $2,700
First Illusions-My Pal Sue

102 Brother Cartel (C 06) Sylvia Shaw Pitman FL $100,000
Corona Cartel-My Streakin Heart

103 Eysa Rare Opener (F 06) Double T Ranch OK $13,000
Mr Eye Opener-Mynewsensation

104 Painted Oak Tree (F 06) Lynn & Becky Husman/Darrell Ander SD $12,500
Oak Tree Special-Miss Eye Paint

105 Nacho Nanny (F 06) Raul Martinez MEX $2,400
Carrion My Cash-Nacho Mamma

106 Jess Naughty (F 06) Lonnie Terwilliger KS $30,000
Take Off Jess-Nadica

107 Aint I Agouti (F 06) Sam Brookover KS $8,000
Agouti-None As Easy

108 Unacompanied Minor (C 06) Salvatory SBC Construction Jonathan TX $1,700
The Down Side-Nativo Esfuerzo

109 Up For Cash (F 06) Graciela Cabanas MEX $7,000
Dashin Is Easy-Natovas Princess

110 A Valentine (F 06) Withdrawn
A Regal Choice-Natural Vallentine

111 JL Zapato (C 06) Pedro Valle AZ $1,500
Beat The Feet (TB)-Nedras Affair

112 Checoy (C 06) Rachuan Suarez MVZ MEX $9,200
Check Him Out-Nike Dash

113 Eye Of Kane (C 06) Arturo O. Salazar MEX $6,500
Mr Eye Opener-No Pure Chicks

114 Steel On Steel (G 06) Repurchase $11,000
Agouti-None As Easy

115 Eye Am Lucky (C 06) Preston L. Cloud OK $14,000
Mr Eye Opener-Oh Just Lucky

116 Shut Up N Zoom (C 06) Withdrawn
Azoom-Oh Shutup N Kiss Me

117 South Okla Rose (F 06) Arturo A. Siller Berain MEX $2,600
Southern Cartel-Okla Rose Lady

118 Double Ole Three (C 06) Dianne Gregg SD $2,000
Ole Heart Throb-Ole Fuzzy Jet

119 Rehab Movie Star (F 06) John Bassett AZ $40,000
First Down Dash-Olenes De Elegant

120 Baja Jazz (F 06) Juan A. Medina X $13,000

Tres Seis-Only The Wicked
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121 Bird Scoop (C 06) Jose Cervantes OK $8,000
Jess Special-O0 The Possibilities

122 Black Jack Murphy (C 06) Ruben Jake Garcia X $20,000
Shazoom-Oodles Of Cash

123 Ez On The Eyes (F 06) Graciela Cabanas MEX $6,000
Dashin Is Easy-Open Your Eyes

124 Forspeed Breezer (F 06) Armando Cortez TX $1,700
Such Easy Cash-Osceola Breezer

125 Missy Suspect (F 06) Peter M. Spada CAN $7,000
Ausual Suspect-Our Miss Tootsie

126 Takin On The Fuzz (C 06) Clyde Peters TN $4,500
Takin On The Cash-Outrun D Fuzz

127 De Easy Jewel (F 06) Repurchase $3,200
Lazy A Dasher-Paleface De Magic

128 The Pampered Side (F 06) Julio Hernandez & Crecencio Huizar X $6,500
The Down Side-Pamper Me Special

129 Ms Southern Cartel (F 06) Repurchase $3,500
Southern Cartel-Pattinforadance

130 RC Pure Effort (C 06) Edwardo S Fuentes MEX $8,700
This Snow Is Royal-Pure Flattery

131 Daleos Girl (F 06) Santana Garza TX $1,600
House of Sport (TB)-Perfect Stepper

132 Mr Jess Perrier (C 06) Dr. Tommy Hays TX $15,000
Holland Ease-Perrier Jouet

133 Fish N Chips (C 06) Repurchase $7,500
Fishers Dash-Pickles

134 Forty Creek (C 06) Salvador Pimienta, Agent AZ $19,000
Feature Mr Jess-Pippips Royal Chick

135 A Hidden Talent (F 06) Dr. J. B. or Sherrie Morace X $1,100
Hestheman (TB)-Plains Pride

136 Play Hard Ball (C 06) Ken & Reba George KS $10,500
Okey Dokey Dale-Play To The End

137 Onewabbitrun (F 06) Repurchase $2,700
Yawls Rabbit-Pleez Me Chick

138 Southern Gold Rush (C 06) Everett Mrakava CAN $19,000
Southern Cartel-Pockatus Gold

139 Precious Boot (F 06) Repurchase $5,800
Spanish Boot-Precious Honor

140 Pretty N Sassy Chic (F 06) Pedro Valle AZ $3,000

Celeb-Pretty An Sassy
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141 Loved Her First (F 06) Celina or Corina Molina AZ $15,000
A Regal Choice-Pretty Jet High

142  Tonozzi (C 06) Lee/Sherwood AZ $20,000
Hawkinson-Prime Time Kid

143 Dash Prissy Dash (F 06) Raymond Petty AR $13,000
Fishers Dash-Prissys Awesome Form

144 Im D Dash (F 06) Repurchase $6,000
Im Dashing-Pure D Hemp

145 No Le Hace Lacorona (C 06) Baldemar Costilla AR $4,200
Agouti-Pure D Joy

146 Tres D Man (G 06) Jim Plume CAN $8,000
Tres Seis-Pure Flattery

147 Dashinski (C 06) Lana Merrick OK $22,000
Special Leader-Queens Run

148 Quick And Painted (F 06) Dream Chaser Farm CAN $4,000
Apollo (TB)-Quick Encore

149 Eyesa Quick Glass (F 06) Gary & Marlene McNichol CAN $15,000
Eyesa Special-Quick Glass

150 Brimmstone (C 06) Repurchase $32,000
Brimmerton-Quick Moon Sign

151 RK Quick N Sweet (F 06) Alfredo Guajardo X $4,000
Sweet First Down-Quick Take

152  Quickie Laveaux (F 06) Max Torres AZ $3,700
First Down Laveaux-Quickie Pie

153  Brimmin Over (C 06) Bobby D. Cox TX $30,000
Brimmerton-Quik Jolla

154  Quins Title (F 06) Jose / Arnulfo A. Osuna TX $600
Title Contender-Quins Dream

155 Flyn Belle Star (F 06) Fernando De La Cruz X $1,500
Fit To Fly-Racine Belle

156 Mr Moon (G 06) Withdrawn
Shoot No-Rainbow Glass

157 Classic Zoom Too (C 06) Diamond S Farm TX $30,000
Shazoom-Royal Classic Chick

158 Purely Prada (F 06) Repurchase $25,000
Brimmerton-Rare Encore

159 Corona Peaks (C 06) Patrick Swan, Agent OK $7,500

Corona Caliente-Rare Peak

160 Peppermint Seis (F 06)
Tres Seis-Rare Peppermint

Withdrawn
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161 Finishnstrong (C 06) Repurchase $7,000
Feature Mr Jess-Rare Temptation

162 Jazzy Lass (F 06) Repurchase $5,700
Special Leader-Rarely Beaten

163 Thats So Money (F 06) Dr. Jay D. Ross OK $8,500
First Smart Money-Rarely Forever

164 Okey Design (F 06) Mike Fields OK $34,000
Okey Dokey Dale-Real Blue Eyes

165 Easy On You (F 06) Scott &/or Lark Linford WYy $3,000
Spanish Boot-Real Easy Night

166 Real Dan Dee (G 06) Eddie Willis OK $8,200
Okey Dokey Dale-Real Karates

167 Beyond Sweet (F 06) Garlon Gerdes X $4,500
Sweet First Down-Real Patriot

168 Take Off Reb (C 06) Dr. Richard Connelley KY $3,000
Take Off Jess-Rebel Lady

169 Shazoom Reigns (F 06) Kenneth L. Doyle DVM OK $13,000
Shazoom-Reign Of Royalty

170 Mr Southern Moon (C 06) Jose Guzman TX $4,200
Southern Cartel-Rita Anns Dash

171  Mr Teton Jess (C 06) Ruben Jake Garcia TX $61,000
Mr Jess Perry-Rockin The Tetons

172 Bayou Wings (C 06) Rogelio Chavhrria Barrera X $16,000
Mr Jess Perry-Rocking Forth

173 Tada Tada (F 06) Manny Silva & Baudelio Munoz IL $6,200
Special Leader-Roll Penny Roll

174  Streakaway Cartel (F 06) Mesquite Pass Farms, Inc Billy Watso TX $3,800
Streakaway Cash-Ronas Cartel

175 Agouti Kid (C 06) Fred A. Woslum OK $8,500
Agouti-Ronas Dawn

176 Rose Among Royalty (F 06) Repurchase $12,000
This Snow Is Royal-Ronas Roses

177 Ronas Royal Shake (F 06) Withdrawn
Beduinos Shake-Ronas Royal Rocket

178 Prairie Dasher (C 06) Withdrawn
Streak And Dash-Roseanna Silk

179 Fast Lane Rose (F 06) Mario & Julio Ramirez X $15,000
Feature Mr Jess-Roses Inthe Fastlane

180 Square And Fair (F 06) Dr. Richard Connelley KY $5,000

Brimmerton-Royal Agate
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181  Mister Dynamic (C 06) Oscar Rohne TX $20,000
Shazoom-Royal Classic Chick

182 Goest (C 06) Teodoro Campos TX $3,700
Bill Cole-Royal Quick Giacomo

183 Quick To Zoom Oh (C 06) Arturo Rivera MEX $9,500
Shazoom-Royal Quick Laico

184 Gol Me Gone (F 06) Gerardo Ramirez TX $6,000
Gol-Run The Meter

185 Ms Runaway Anywhere (F 06) Raymond G. Valerio NM $12,000
Make It Anywhere-Runaway Prima Donna

186 Way Mor Zoom (F 06) Salvador Pimienta, Agent AZ $28,500
Shazoom-Runaway Rumors

187 Runninforme (C 06) Rudy Ramirez OK $12,500
Corona For Me-Runninbac

188 Some Girlz Do (F 06) Manuel Ramos Jr. TX $4,700
Hawkish-Ryons Gold Dasher

189 BP Dashin Cartel (C 06) Withdrawn
Southern Cartel-Rita Anns Dash

190 Dashazoom (C 06) Johnny Trotter X $37,000
Azoom-Sables Dash

191 Katabatic Wind (F 06) Double T Ranch OK $14,000
A Regal Choice-Sailin Martha

192 SC Apolos Gold (C 06) Hector Fraire OK $12,000
Fishin Kisses-Sailin Shoes

193 Breakfast On Me (F 06) Rusty Patterson TX $4,000
Dash Thru Traffic-Salty Toast

194 Takin Cash Only (C 06) Juan Viesca MEX $3,300
Takin On The Cash-Say Digit

195 Majestic Eye (C 06) Arturo Siller Berain MEX $12,000
Mr Eye Opener-Say Six Moons

196 Corona In The Snow (C 06) Rusty Patterson X $2,600
Corona For Me-Scarlet Snow

197 Zoomin Fortune (C 06) Cesar J. Dabdoub AZ $19,500
Shazoom-Scarletts Fortone

198 TF Canucatcher (F 06) Repurchase $4,000
Come On Boots-Scoopie Coochie

199 Swingbatterbatter (C 06) Charles E. Farnsworth/R Miller/D Rap CA $29,000
Mr Eye Opener-Secret In Stone

200 Money For A Secret (C 06) Link Newcomb & Micah Leslie CA $16,000

First Smart Money-Secret Interlude
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201 Ala Secret Rose (F 06) Withdrawn
Super De Kas-Secret Meter

202 Heres Ur Sign (F 06) Gerardo Ramirez X $21,000
Make It Anywhere-Secret Signing

203 See The Feature (C 06) Buckey & Beverly Stockwell NM $22,000
Feature Mr Jess-See Me Do It

204 SR Skywalker (C 06) JLS Speed Horse Ranch, Inc. LA $17,000
Separatist-Serenity Dash

205 Man Law (C 06) Mario L. Saenz TX $13,000
Mr Eye Opener-Sexy Shania

206 Most Feared (C 06) Mauricio Morin TX $5,000
Stoli-Seychelle

207 Eyesa Quick Lady (F 06) Keith Renfro TN $11,500
Eyesa Special-Shake Em Quick

208 Shakeitshazoom (F 06) Victor Muzquiz TX $6,000
Shazoom-Shake It Out

209 Millers Classic (C 06) Repurchase $1,700
Cartel Dancer-Shamrocks Classic

210 Reverent (C 06) Larry Keith X $4,200
Prescience-Shanes Reverie

211 Holyfinale (F 06) Ed Melzer OK $6,000
First To Shine-Shawne Finale

212 Eazoom (F 06) Rusty Carpenter OK $21,000
Shazoom-She Blushes Easy

213  Brimmertons Angel (F 06) Repurchase $9,000
Brimmerton-She Snow Angel

214 Happy Feet (C 06) Warren & Geraldine J. Buck Elk, Sr. SD $19,000
Mr Eye Opener-Shenoshezroyal

215 Chisled Specialbedun (C 06) Cristino Estrada OK $9,500
SC Chiseled In Stone-Shes Chicks Kiss

216 Really Southern (F 06) Rodolfo J. Sanchez X $5,700
Southern Cartel-Shes Really Quick

217 Eye Got Chrome (C 06) Withdrawn
Mr Eye Opener-Shes Really Royal

218 Doppler Radar (F 06) Double T Ranch OK $32,000
Hawkinson-Shesafriendly Bug

219 Hot Shotten (C 06) Fernando Aguirre TX $6,000

Righteous Brother-Shesaspeedin Bullet

220 Its Snowing On Me (F 06)
Feature Mr Jess-Shez A Snow Me

Withdrawn
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221 Feature Ten (C 06) Lee/Sherwood AZ $22,000
Feature Mr Jess-Shez Ten First

222  Duce Coupe (C 06) Repurchase $9,000
Takin On The Cash-Sheza Coup De Kas

223 Katie Dash (F 06) Doug McMullen TX $16,500
Stoli-Sheza Special Beam

224  Shes A Legal Celab (F 06) Rene Morales NM $3,200
Celeb-Shezz Lajitt

225 Signed Zoomin (C 06) Ben Garza, Agent X $14,500
Shazoom-Shirleys Signature

226 Worth A Risk (F 06) Ramon Martinez Mexic $40,000
Corona Cartel-Short List

227  Shoulda Corona (C 06) Juan Fauela TX $2,500
Cartel Dancer-Shoulda Coulda

228 Da Brimfull (F 06) Ruben Jake Garcia TX $5,500
Brimmerton-Show Me The Wire

229 Deliver Me A Corona (C 06) Daurin Williams OK $3,000
Coronas Prospect-Sign Sealed Deliver

230 Prime Silk (C 06) David L. Martinez X $5,500
Prime Talent-Silk Poppy

231 Make It Silver (F 06) Robert J. Touchet, Agent X $12,500
Make It Anywhere-Silver Tongued Chick

232 Unnamed Yearling (C 06) Jose Antonio Sole MEX $4,500
Corona For Me-Silverheels

233  Surprise Ending (F 06) Johnny Trotter X $17,000
Royal Quick Dash-Sinful Shenanigans

234  Sooner Or Better (F 06) Melba De La Cerda TX $30,000
Okey Dokey Dale-Sinfully Easy

235 Fearless Bully (C 06) Castulo Sierra MEX $9,000
Bully Bullion-Sissy Killer Salls

236 Eyesa Sixarun Gunner (F 06) Salvador Pimienta, Agent AZ $9,500
Eyesa Special-Six Gun Annie

237  Six Pistol (F 06) Rachuan Suarez MVZ MEX $17,500
Mr Eye Opener-Six Guns N Garters

238 Jess On The Beach (F 06) HJS-Marcolo Jorge Brazil $43,000
Mr Jess Perry-Six On The Beach

239 Infrared Six (C 06) Repurchase $4,200
Red (TB)-Sixes Prize

240 Heza Fast High (G 06) Withdrawn

Heza Fast Man-Sixty N High
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9/20/2007 - 9/22/2007

SESSION ONE /Yearling

Hip # Horse (Sex & Birth Year) / Sire-Dam / [Covering Sire] Buyer State Price

241 Sixy Royal King (C 06) Withdrawn
Royal Shake Em-Sixy Thru Traffic

242  Southern Irish (C 06) Arturo O. Salazar MEX $3,000
Southern Cartel-Sky Dashin

243  Ppitch Special (G 06) Ramiro Villarreal, Agent MEX $8,500
Special Leader-Snafolsmobile

244  Snazzy Special Lead (G 06) Denny & Sandy Weigt 1D $6,500
Special Leader-Snazzy Be Kas

245 Apache Nation (C 06) Santana Garza X $4,000
Corona Caliente-Snow Ghost

246  Snows Cutie (F 06) Repurchase $15,000
Royal Shake Em-Snowmass

247 Rock Star Super Nova (F 06) Manuel Ramos Jr. X $10,000
Strawflyin Buds-Solid Dash

248 Down Side Moolah (F 06) Tom Maher SD $4,000
The Down Side-Some Moolah

249 Here Is The Son (C 06) Tyler Graham, Agent X $7,200
Jody O Toole-Sooner Take Greene

250 Pachamama (F 06) Larry H. Hughes CcO $5,700
The Down Side-Sorority Serenade

251 Holland South (C 06) Repurchase $11,000
Holland Ease-Southern Fun

252  Classykisser (F 06) Gerardo Nunez NM $2,500
Hez Class-Southern Kisses

253 The Decider (C 06) Repurchase $3,500
Carrion My Cash-Sparkling Cassia

254 Genuinely Shazoomin (C 06) Javier Lujan X $19,000
Shazoom-Special And Genuine

255 Make It Magical JLS (F 06) Gilbert Davila X $4,500
Make It Anywhere-Special Blush

256 Speeding Effort (C 06) Luis/Erasmo Preciado NM $1,800
Extra Special Effort-Special Dimples

257 B Effort (C 06) James Kelly AZ $6,000
The Down Side-Special Entery

258 Cajun Eye Opener (F 06) Teressa Hansen SD $25,500
Mr Eye Opener-Special Heart

259 Kiss The Bride (F 06) Rachuan Suarez MVZ MEX $7,000
Royal Shake Em-Special Jet Liz

260 Zoomerata (F 06) Withdrawn

Shazoom-Special Lady Gambler
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SALE RESULTS LIST BY SESSION

2007 Quarter Horse Yearling
9/20/2007 - 9/22/2007

SESSION ONE /Yearling

Hip # Horse (Sex & Birth Year) / Sire-Dam / [Covering Sire] Buyer State Price

261 Meganetteshinesfirst (F 06) J. W. Owens/Jose Maldonado X $7,000
First To Shine-Special Meganette

262 Dimty (C 06) Tom Lyons, Inc. TX $15,500
Mr Eye Opener-Special Phebe

263 Special First Toast (C 06) Johnny Trotter/ Pete Scarmardo X $11,000
First To Shine-Special Timeto Toast

264 Talented Empress (F 06) Repurchase $20,000
Prime Talent-Speedy Empress

265 A Royal Spin (C 06) Jim H. Olson MN $10,000
Royal Quick Dash-Spin A Fortune

266 Heza Runaway (C 06) Armando Athayde X $7,000
Heza Fast Dash-Spirit Of Giving

267 Shes Splashin (F 06) Jon Blonquist uT $9,000
Special Leader-Splash Of A Flash

268 Winners Dreams (F 06) Repurchase $7,800
Runaway Winner-Spota Fortunes

269 Granite Ghost (C 06) Kirby & Cathy Kile MO $3,000
Granite Lake-Spur Up Cash

270 Wheelin Dasher (F 06) Ramon A Valencia AZ $2,700
Some Dasher-Squealy Wheely

271 South Bound Katrina (F 06) Thomas H. Bradbury/Bill & Marsha D CO $14,500
Southern Cartel-Star Of Katrina

272 Make And Model (C 06) Kenneth L. Roberts LA $7,700
Prime Talent-Steel Magnolias

273  Sis Stoli (F 06) Repurchase $10,000
Stoli-Stella D Oro

274  Thrillvania (F 06) Humberto Perez Morales MEX $25,000
Shazoom-Stellar Queen

275 Quick Gas (C 06) Gary W. Schreiner IL $10,000
Royal Quick Dash-Steppin On The Gas

276  Such A Good Girl (F 06) HJS-Marcolo Jorge Brazil $17,500
Feature Mr Jess-Still Do Dashin

277 Hes A Dirty Streaker (C 06) David Meridyth TX $4,000
Make It Anywhere-Streakin Dirty

278 Eyesa Firefly (F 06) Roberto Valdez Perez MEX $5,700
Eyesa Special-Streakin Firefly

279 Braggin Rights (C 06) Pete Scaramado X $27,000
Mr Eye Opener-Streakin First Down

280 Unnamed Yearling (C 06) Withdrawn

Ausual Suspect-Streakin Jody
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SALE RESULTS LIST BY SESSION
2007 Quarter Horse Yearling

9/20/2007 - 9/22/2007

SESSION ONE /Yearling

Hip # Horse (Sex & Birth Year) / Sire-Dam / [Covering Sire] Buyer State Price

281  Stoli Raptor (F 06) Edward or Theresa Denike WA $16,000
Stoli-Streakin Millie

282 Oscar Stop Streakin (F 06) Buford Rediker TN $2,500
De Elegant Oscar-Streakin Orchis

283  Streakin Signer (C 06) Jose Cervantes OK $12,500
Mr Eye Opener-Streakin Sign

284  Streakin Six Cartel (C 06) Julian C. Angel GA $95,000
Corona Cartel-Streakin Six Love

285 Dasha Easy (F 06) Repurchase $52,000
A Regal Choice-Such An Easy Effort

286 Unnamed Yearling (C 06) Withdrawn
Mr Jess Perry-Summer Bliss

287 Take Em Out (C 06) Raul Madrigal X $9,500
Takin On The Cash-Sunday Smash

288 RK Super Prospect (F 06) Arturo O. Salazar MEX $3,000
Coronas Prospect-Super Carrie Dee

289 Nitro Blaster (C 06) Withdrawn
Alabama Schoolboy-Super Cash Bonus

290 Azoom For Cash (F 06) Mario L. Saenz X $21,500
Azoom-Sweet As Cash

291 Sweet Adieu (F 06) Manny Silva & Baudelio Munoz IL $3,300
The Corona-Sweet As Snow

292 Sweet Oak Special (F 06) Preston L. Cloud OK $20,500
Oak Tree Special-Sweet Caldonia

293 Eyell Fly Away (C 06) Withdrawn
Mr Eye Opener-Sweet Candy Rose

294 Carlyo Colt (C 06) Lloyd J Counts III ND $4,500
Fishers Dash-Sweet Carlyo

295 Sweetdimpleslilacorn (F 06) Jose Antonio Sole MEX $6,200
Oak Tree Special-Sweet Dimples Dash

296 A Sweet Tooth (F 06) Jim D. Pitts TX $17,000
Brimmerton-Sweet Indulgence

297 Jess Sweet (F 06) Jose L. Salazar X $10,200
Fishers Dash-Sweet Jessica James

298 Hawkin Bebes (F 06) Eleazar Martinez X $6,000
Hawkinson-Sweet Sebe

299 Down At The Lux (F 06) Double Eagle Ranch NM $25,000
The Down Side-Sweetly Special

300 Your Agouti (F 06) Gary & Marlene McNichol CAN $4,700

Agouti-Syncopate Your Mama
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SALE RESULTS LIST BY SESSION
2007 Quarter Horse Yearling

9/20/2007 - 9/22/2007

SESSION ONE /Yearling

Hip # Horse (Sex & Birth Year) / Sire-Dam / [Covering Sire] Buyer State Price

301 Nxces (F 06) Arturo Ibarra TX $7,000
Likenothinyoueversaw-Secret Interlude

302 Take The Mountain (C 06) Alvaro Sepulveda MEX $28,000
Panther Mountain-Take Dad The Cash

303 I Run Real Fast (C 06) James Sills X $15,000
Heza Fast Man-Take The Special

304 Two Buds Knute (G 06) Alfredo Triana TX $1,500
Runnigan-Takin On The Action

305 Threestridestothwire (C 06) Repurchase $8,700
Royal Quick Dash-Takin On The Ritz

306 Tear Drop Seven (F 06) Armando Athayde X $5,000
Eyesa Special-Tear Drop Six

307 Streakin For Pop (F 06) Roy or Sue Barrington X $3,500
Royal Streakin-Tees Funza Poppin

308 Hyper Blast (F 06) Arturo O. Salazar MEX $9,000
Separatist-Tell Her More

309 Tell Em Shes Gone (F 06) Repurchase $49,000
Mr Jess Perry-Teller Cash

310 Zoomin And Lyin (C 06) Arturo O. Salazar MEX $16,000
Shazoom-Teller Lies

311 Teller N Telleragain (F 06) John Bassett AZ $47,000
Corona Cartel-Teller Queen

312 Lady Streakin Leader (F 06) Frankie Martinez NM $9,500
Special Leader-Ten N Six

313 Righteous Tessa (F 06) Tom Maher SD $1,700
Righteous Brother-Tessas Coasting

314 Pretty Boy Bullion (C 06) John Read Foster KY $7,700
Bully Bullion-Texannas Dash

315 Thatsjustsouthern (F 06) Ashwood Farms X $5,000
Southern Cartel-Thatsjustaboutright

316 Atomic Royal (C 06) Rusty Patterson X $2,100
Sixes Royal-The Atomic Rocket

317 Rico Wrangler (C 06) Gerardo Nunez NM $1,700

Rapid Selection-The Chasor
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SALE RESULTS LIST BY SESSION
2007 Quarter Horse Yearling

9/20/2007 - 9/22/2007

SESSION ONE /Yearling

Hip # Horse (Sex & Birth Year) / Sire-Dam / [Covering Sire] Buyer State Price
TOTAL SESSION ONE /YEARLING
Total Horses Sold = 245 $2,808,800.00 Average = $11,464.49
Total Repurchases = 46 $557,200.00 Average = $12,113.04
Total Transactions = 291 $3,366,000.00 Average = $11,567.01
Total Withdrawn = 25
Total No Bid =
Total No Sale = 0
Total Horses = 317
TOTAL THROUGH 1ST SESSION
Total Horses Sold = 245 $2,808,800.00 Average = $11,464.49
Total Repurchases = 46 $557,200.00 Average = $12,113.04
Total Transactions = 291 $3,366,000.00 Average = $11,567.01
Total Withdrawn = 25
Total No Bid = 1
Total No Sale = 0
Total Horses = 317
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SALE RESULTS LIST BY SESSION
2007 Quarter Horse Yearling

9/20/2007 - 9/22/2007

SESSION TWO /Yearling

Hip # Horse (Sex & Birth Year) / Sire-Dam / [Covering Sire] Buyer State Price

318 CS Southern Honey (F 06) Repurchase $5,000
Southern Cartel-The Honeymoons Over

319 Perriously (C 06) Doug McMullen X $6,700
Take Off Jess-The Texas Sunset

320 Iamasurebet (C 06) Clarence Scharbauer, Jr. X $57,000
Feature Mr Jess-Think Twice About It

321 This Fishers Fast (C 06) Randy Garrett KS $4,500
Fishers Dash-This Candys Fast

322 Stole The Candy (C 06) Paul Treadwell KS $30,000
Stoli-This Candys Special

323 Eye Opening Chick (F 06) Jane P Woodward X $9,000
Mr Eye Opener-This Chicks A Ruler

324 Corona Dude Dancer (C 06) Repurchase $2,500
Cartel Dancer-This Chicks For You

325 Dreams Magnified (C 06) Dr. J. B. or Sherrie Morace X $10,000
Tres Seis-Three Dee Dreams

326 JL Marquis (F 06) J. D. Anderson OK $1,000
SF Royal Quick Flash-Three Rumors

327 Valentine Hunk (C 06) Ramiro Villarreal, Agent MEX $5,200
Check Him Out-Time For Juliette

328 Time For Streaking (C 06) Rachuan Suarez MVZ MEX $15,000
Streakin La Jolla-Time For Royal Cash

329 Royal Anywhere (C 06) Arturo Siller Berain MEX $7,500
Make It Anywhere-Time For Royalty

330 E Z Eye (C06) Repurchase $17,500
Mr Eye Opener-Time To Beduino

331  Britt Junior (C 06) Carol Robertson CAN $10,000
Bully Bullion-Timely Rhythm

332 Vino Selection (C 06) John & Robin C. Thurmond X $1,600
Rapid Selection-Tintas Chick

333 Comin Thru (C 06) Randy & Stacy L. Hill OK $15,500
Separatist-To Catch A Fly

334 Vals Native Heart (F 06) Withdrawn
Dashing Val-To The Heart

335 Twocheckstobeck (G 06) Repurchase $1,600
Corona Czech-Tobeck

336 Awsom Alice (F 06) Rachuan Suarez MVZ MEX $11,500
Shazoom-Too Much Temptation

337 Top Of The City (C 06) Tara Sanders OK $700

City Street (TB)-Top Time Dash

Jun 10, 2010 - 11:49 am

Page 18 of 34



SALE RESULTS LIST BY SESSION
2007 Quarter Horse Yearling

9/20/2007 - 9/22/2007

SESSION TWO /Yearling

Hip # Horse (Sex & Birth Year) / Sire-Dam / [Covering Sire] Buyer State Price

338 Jess A Traffic Jam (C 06) Cynthia L. or Charles Warren Sr. OK $20,000
Feature Mr Jess-Traffic Ten Too

339 Shining Sixes (C 06) Keithon Roberts MD $8,500
First To Shine-Tricky Memories

340 Coronas Special Jet (F 06) Jerardo Lopez Hernandez OK $2,400
Coronas Prospect-Triple Show Girl

341 Tequila Martini (C 06) L. Joe & Judith O. Chappell Trust OK $5,700
Separatist-Turner On

342 Cartel Special (C 06) Jerardo Lopez Hernandez OK $1,700
Cartel Dancer-Twice As Special

343 Fly Me Anywhere (C 06) Joshua Harner & Ed Hardy X $12,500
Make It Anywhere-Two Sick To Fly

344 Alazaam (C 06) Repurchase $19,000
Azoom-Tylers Cash Flow

345 Queen Of The Cartel (F 06) Joe Merrick OK $85,000
Corona Cartel-Teller Queen

346 Vals Easy Cash (F 06) John C. Moses Jr. KS $3,000
Biduino-Val Lee Kay

347 The Shazoom Alliance (F 06) Jesus Cuevas & Jesus Avila CA $14,000
Shazoom-Valentine Alliance

348 Good Looking Stone (F 06) Abelardo Castro TX $4,000
SC Chiseled In Stone-Vegas On My Mind

349 A Zooming Jet (F 06) Bob Hardy TX $10,700
Shazoom-Velarde

350 Vertical Vision (C 06) Danny A Miller AR $5,200
Visionarian-Vertical Horizon

351 Stolis Winner (C 06) Repurchase $32,000
Stoli-Veva Jean

352 Flash His Dimples (C 06) Jeff Tyer OK $3,000
SF Royal Quick Flash-View Her Dimple

353 No Vip To See (F 06) Henry A. Woodruff X $8,000
Likenothinyoueversaw-VIP Treatment

354 Do Ya Dream (C 06) Repurchase $14,500
Special Leader-Yeah Yeah I Do

355 Wash It Down (F 06) Roberto C. Gonzalez X $12,500
The Down Side-Wash And Wear

356 Special Watch DH (F 06) Jesus Garza MEX $6,700
Okey Dokey Dale-Watch This Guys

357 Czechs Star Burst (F 06) Jose L. Salazar X $5,000

Corona Czech-Watta Proud Baby
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SALE RESULTS LIST BY SESSION
2007 Quarter Horse Yearling

9/20/2007 - 9/22/2007

SESSION TWO /Yearling

Hip # Horse (Sex & Birth Year) / Sire-Dam / [Covering Sire] Buyer State Price

358 Brimmerwear (F 06) * Lloyd Counts, Jr. ND $5,000
Brimmerton-Wear And Tear

359 Seneca Hot Miss (F 06) Alex Baeza X $4,000
Okey Dokey Dale-White Hot Miss

360 Whos Fit (F 06) Alberto Baeza NM $3,700
Fit To Fly-Whos Smokin 109

361 Eye Can Imagine (C 06) Guerras Racing Stables X $4,000
Mr Eye Opener-Windy Martha

362 Jessaquicky (C 06) Sammy C. or Johnny C. Martinez NM $50,000
Royal Quick Dash-Windy Perry

363 Chama River (C 06) David & Tyler Graham TX $10,000
Panther Mountain-Wisdom Keeper

364 Wooden Boot (C 06) Rusty Patterson X $4,200
Spanish Boot-Woodstocks Chic

365 Toy Choo Choo (F 06) Barbara Whitney & Alison Richardson OK $6,700
Royal Blue Chew Chew-Worms Little Finger

366 WSS Striking Bug (F 06) Carlos Orozco X $2,400
Striking Distance-WSS Really Bugin

367 Stoli Bedlam (F 06) Burnett Ranches, LLC X $24,000
Stoli-Wash And Wear

368 Stol The Flight (F 06) Withdrawn
Stoli-Yeah Im Flying

369 Kazzin Ado (C 06) Manuel Ramos Jr. X $9,500
Super De Kas-Yeah Yeah I Do

370 ZZ Snowmobile (F 06) Repurchase $5,000
This Snow Is Royal-Zeezat Zevi

371 Bye Bye John Dillan (C 06) Raul Madrigal X $3,200
Dashin Bye-Zelena Zbar

372 KR Optical Illusion (C 06) Victor De La Garza Salazar MEX $5,000
Mr Eye Opener-Zevi Jean

373 My Eyedol (C 06) Jesus Guillermo Gonzalez Andrade MEX $11,000
Mr Eye Opener-Zevi Queen

374 Zimalue (F 06) JC & Sons Stables X $6,700
Jess Louisiana Blue-Zip Zima

375 Zoyies Prospect (F 06) Repurchase $4,000
Coronas Prospect-Zoyie

376 Yeah Im Leading (F 06) Robert A. Feilner uTt $11,000
Special Leader-Yeah Yeah I Do

377 Jess Shifting (C 06) Miguel A Carbajal X $7,500

Feature Mr Jess-A Dancing Queen
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SALE RESULTS LIST BY SESSION
2007 Quarter Horse Yearling

9/20/2007 - 9/22/2007

SESSION TWO /Yearling

Hip # Horse (Sex & Birth Year) / Sire-Dam / [Covering Sire] Buyer State Price

378 Flash N Passion (F 06) Bob Johnson SD $2,500
Take Off Jess-A Dream Deferred

379 Isa Party Crasher (F 06) Johnny Trotter X $29,000
Mr Eye Opener-A Faster Rabbit

380 Kitty Kat Dat (F 06) Repurchase $12,000
Panther Mountain-A Legal Alternative

381 Her Eyes Are Open (F 06) Michael Vigil NM $25,000
Mr Eye Opener-A Little Ingenuity

382 First Dash Jess (C 06) Jesus Avila/Jesus Cuevas/Apolinar Ri CA $10,000
Take Off Jess-A Safe Bet

383 Radical Eyezd (C 06) James Kelly AZ $8,000
Mr Eye Opener-A Special Endeavor

384 Looks Righteous (C 06) Raul Madrigal TX $3,500
Righteous Brother-A Sweet Look

385 State Your Business (F 06) Salvador A. Lozano X $7,000
Shazoom-A Tooty Fruity Baby

386 Seperatestar (F 06) Johnny Trotter X $35,000
Separatist-Abstinence

387 Addigo (C 06) Enrigue Rios, Jr. CcO $10,000
Agouti-Addietakesall

388 Corona My Love (F 06) Withdrawn
Corona For Me-Adoringly

389 My Lady Hawk (F 06) Salvador A. Lozano TX $5,000
Hawkinson-Aimees Classy

390 Secret Agent Man (C 06) Withdrawn
A Regal Choice-Aint It Fun

391 Paddy Whacked (F 06) Lloyd J Counts III ND $6,500
Oak Tree Special-Air Mail Express

392 Hes A Teller (C 06) Repurchase $19,000
Azoom-All Aglimmer

393 Tres Seis Allegation (F 06) Robert A. Feilner uTt $10,000
Tres Seis-Allegations

394 Movin East (F 06) Withdrawn
Shazoom-Allen's Cashmere

395 Lonely Voice (F 06) Doug McMullen X $11,000
Hawkinson-Alotta Bugsy

396 Always Zoomin (C 06) James Sills X $14,000
Shazoom-Always Precious

397 Run Like Fire (C 06) Edward Ross Hardy TX $3,700

Walk Thru Fire-Amys Best Move
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9/20/2007 - 9/22/2007

SESSION TWO /Yearling

Hip # Horse (Sex & Birth Year) / Sire-Dam / [Covering Sire] Buyer State Price

398 Insurgent (C 06) Repurchase $10,000
Agouti-An Easy Runner

399 Knud Hawker (F 06) Luis Chacon MEX $7,500
Hawkinson-Angel Layne

400 Old Christine (F 06) Arturo O. Salazar MEX $5,200
Granite Lake-Angelina Six

401 Memories In The Snow (F 06) Alejandro Garza MEX $22,000
This Snow Is Royal-Angels Memory

402 Agouti Special (C 06) Withdrawn
Agouti-Angies Super Effort

403 Eyes A Shazoom (F 06) Danny R. Caldwell OK $8,500
Shazoom-Annie Eye Over

404 Anywhere By Six (C 06) Sergio Marquez TX $9,500
Make It Anywhere-Apollo Six Moon

405 Down In Dirty (F 06) Pedro Alcala X $9,200
The Down Side-Apollos Darlin

406 Brimmertons Song (F 06) Sammy Manek OK $3,500
Brimmerton-Arethas Song

407 Girlsandacoronaforme (C 06) Repurchase $7,000
Corona For Me-Asnow Girl

408 Abbys Shazoom (C 06) Repurchase $10,000
Shazoom-Awesome Abby

409 A Separate Blossom (F 06) Double Eagle Ranch NM $29,000
Separatist-Awesome Blossom

410 Cosmosphere (C 06) Salvador Pimienta, Agent AZ $10,200
Shazoom-Awesome Just Awesome

411 Baker Grade (C 06) Alfredo Gonzalez TX $11,500
A Regal Choice-Azure Leavin

412  Own The Waterfront (F 06) Repurchase $39,000
Separatist-Babe On The Beach

413 Leavin Fast Man (G 06) Withdrawn
Heza Fast Man-Baby Evan

414 Babyzoomin (F 06) Repurchase $13,000
Shazoom-Babydashn

415 The Rose Of Sharon (F 06) Double T Ranch OK $20,000
Mr Eye Opener-Baltimore Lou

416 Eye Gotta Dash (C 06) Repurchase $11,500
Mr Eye Opener-Banana Bambi

417 Sassie Miss Bully (F 06) Jose / Arnulfo A. Osuna X $1,500

Rapid Selection-Bashful Bully
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SESSION TWO /Yearling

Hip # Horse (Sex & Birth Year) / Sire-Dam / [Covering Sire] Buyer State Price

418 Cougar Valley (F 06) Dr. Roman R. Garza TX $6,000
Panther Mountain-BCR Dashing Moon

419 Trail Ridge Road (C 06) Alvaro Sepulveda MEX $21,000
A Regal Choice-BCR Pass The Purse

420 Beccas Speeding (F 06) Christine A. Hovey IA $9,000
The Down Side-Beccas Sizzling Six

421  Beckys First Down (F 06) Bob Hardy TX $3,000
Granite Lake-Becky Smash

422 Beckys Fast Doll (F 06) * Lloyd Counts, Jr. ND $5,000
Heza Fast Man-Beckys Perfect Webb

423 Charivna (F 06) Jim D. Pitts X $62,000
First Down Dash-Beduino Dancer

424  Roberto Rocket (C 06) Raul Martinez Gonzalez MEX $2,000
Sweet First Down-Beduinos Chick Jet

425 Zoom Man (C 06) Alvaro Sepulveda MEX $15,000
Azoom-Betterthan Chocolate

426 BT Bettor Cartel (C 06) John Mayers TX $10,500
Brimmerton-Bettor Cartel

427  Fly Scraper (F 06) Withdrawn
Strawflyin Buds-Big On Charm

428 Strawflys Royal Debt (F 06) Withdrawn
Sum Fun To Bet-Big Royal Moon

429 Big Bizooms (F 06) Javier Lujan TX $6,500
Shazoom-Bizarre

430 Mr Hanky (C 06) Withdrawn
Stoli-Blaze Of Orion

431 Jess Bluegrass (C 06) Repurchase $75,000
Mr Jess Perry-Blue Grass Bounce

432 ]S Rare Rascal Two (C 06) Repurchase $6,000
Rare Bar-Bon Bon Mama

433  Waiting (F 06) MI&F Partnership X $5,700
Hawkinson-Bon Ton Sweetie

434 Open Star (F 06) Humberto Perez Morales MEX $15,000
Mr Eye Opener-Bonnie Rig

435 Litt Oak Special (C 06) Dick Wellborn & Ken Wallen NM $6,000
Oak Tree Special-Bootsie Lassie

436 Eye Promise You Gold (F 06) Repurchase $8,500
Mr Eye Opener-Break N Promises

437 BS Mr Jess (C 06) Repurchase $28,000

Feature Mr Jess-Bubba Suz
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SESSION TWO /Yearling
Hip # Horse (Sex & Birth Year) / Sire-Dam / [Covering Sire] Buyer State Price

438 Pass N By Cole (F 06) F. Bert Lamb OK $3,000
Bill Cole-Buff Star Yawl

439 Shake Em Not Stirred (C 06) Salvador Pimienta, Agent AZ $21,000
Royal Shake Em-Bullderdash

440 Easy Parr Five (F 06) Sonny Vaughn OK $5,800
Holland Ease-Bullie Parr

441  Truth Or Consequence (G 06) Repurchase $3,200
Dashin Bye-Butane Barby

442 GW Goodbye Heartache (F 06) Christine Tavares CAN $18,500
Agouti-Bye Bye Memories

443  Shakem White Chic (F 06) Alfredo Gonzalez X $4,200
Shake Em White-Bymea Chic

444  Call Me The Count (C 06) Withdrawn
Count Corona-Call Me The Concord

445 Royal Lady Zane (F 06) Repurchase $5,000
This Snow Is Royal-Callie Allen

446 Imanamesomechick (F 06) Withdrawn
Feature Mr Jess-Canadian Chick

447 Love Dale (F 06) George F. Rivera X $4,200
Okey Dokey Dale-Cant Hide Love

448  With An Attitude (F 06) Ashwood Farms TX $5,000
Prescience-Cash Attitude

449  Apolliticat (F 06) Jose Antonio Sole MEX $7,200
Apollo (TB)-Cash In The Kitty

450 Corona Top Cat (C 06) Diamond G Quarter Horse Farm, LLC TX $22,000
Corona Cartel-Catty Miss Cat

451 Royal Dash Of Pepper (C 06) Repurchase $7,000
Royal Quick Dash-Cayenne Pepper

452  Run Agouti (F 06) Double T Ranch OK $7,000
Agouti-Cee Mattie Mae

453 Bills Charly (C 06) Salvador A. Lozano X $2,000
Bills Ryon-Charlies Angel TM

454  Chasethis Separatist (C 06) Arturo O. Salazar MEX $14,500
Separatist-Chasethisblurr

455 Beautiful To Me (F 06) David J. Devany TX $30,000
Shazoom-Check It To Em Miss

456 Traffic Cartel (C 06) Repurchase $7,500
Southern Cartel-Chic N Traffic

457  Jess Vicki (F 06) Arbuckle Stables OK $16,000

Spit Curl Jess-Chica Bye Bye
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458  Polly For Sure (F 06) Jesus Elsa Rojo Cco $10,000
The Down Side-Chicks For Sure

459 Kissing Oak Tree (F 06) John Mayers X $25,000
Oak Tree Special-Chicks Kiss

460 Passionatfirst (F 06) Windy Acres Stables X $20,000
First To Shine-Chicks Passion

461 BP Cartels Diamond (F 06) Repurchase $2,200
Southern Cartel-Childress Diamond

462 T O Cash (G 06) Baldemar Costilla AR $4,500
Takin On The Cash-Christinas Crystal

463 Macanudo (C 06) Manny Silva & Baudelio Munoz IL $12,000
The Down Side-Cinnamon Nutmeg

464 Classic Shazoom (F 06) S & B Green Investments MO $11,000
Shazoom-Classic Bully

465 A Classic Brimmerton (C 06) Repurchase $17,000
Brimmerton-Classic Guitar

466 Classic Hearts (F 06) Withdrawn
Agouti-Classic Keepsake

467 Princesa De Nieve (F 06) Repurchase $6,000
This Snow Is Royal-Classy N Sixy

468 Jess Till Seven (C 06) Doug McMullen & Tim Lange X $6,000
Jess Special-Claudette Seven

469 Coles Bully (C 06) Jesus Elsa Rojo Cco $4,500
Bill Cole-Coco Bullion

470 Brimmertron (C 06) Arturo Ibarra TX $12,500
Brimmerton-Coed On A High

471 Calling Legs Collect (F 06) Erik Lehtinen/Steve Hunter CAN $5,000
The Corona-Collect Caller

472 Heza Darlin (C 06) Manny Silva & Baudelio Munoz IL $2,100
Heza Fast Man-Contessa Darlin

473  Sixy To The Brimm (F 06) Enrique Rios, Jr. Cco $6,000
Brimmerton-Cool N Sixy

474 RK First Runaway (C 06) Saul Colin OK $4,000
Sweet First Down-Cottons Runaway

475  Pretty Woman KN (F 06) Abelardo Castro TX $5,200
SC Chiseled In Stone-Count The Colours

476 Eyesa Countess (F 06) Bob Johnson SD $6,700
Eyesa Special-Countess Caprice

477  Coup De Bill (C 06) Jim Rathjen X $1,500

Bill Cole-Coup De Love
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478 Shake Em And Deal (C 06) Tommy & Jennifer Weeks X $3,700
Royal Shake Em-Creme De Creole

479 Java Buzz (C 06) Oscar Rohne TX $30,000
Dash Ta Fame-Creme De Mocha

480 Magic N Miracles (F 06) Gilbert Davila X $5,000
Dean Miracle-CRP Blackmagic

481 Takin A Cruz (C 06) Andrew T. Smith OK $5,000
Takin On The Cash-Cruising Winner

482 Crystal Dasher (C 06) Repurchase $1,700
Some Dasher-Crystals Jewel

483 Behr (C 06) Ronald Read X $8,500
Panther Mountain-Cymbidiam

484 Roan E Motion (F 06) Mark Antoni IN $10,500
SC Chiseled In Stone-Cystal Motion

485 Dianetobewitcha (C 06) Withdrawn
Southern Cartel-Dianetomeetcha

486 Runnin My Way (G 06) Sergio Marques X $2,200
Biduino-Dancin With Diamonds

487 Dark And De Elegant (C 06) Michael Vigil NM $2,000
De Elegant Oscar-Dark Torment

488 Royal Quick Beth (F 06) Efren Garria MEX $15,700
Royal Quick Dash-Darlin Beth

489 Wannabeone (F 06) Ramon Martinez Mexic $17,500
Shazoom-Dash In The Clouds

490 Takin On Olene (C 06) Gary K. Walker OK $8,500
Takin On The Cash-Dash Olene Too

491 Shez On The Zoom (F 06) 0 Dan & Erin Knox TX $53,000
Azoom-Dash Ten Too

492 Edmonton (C 06) Salvador Pimienta, Agent AZ $10,000
Hawkinson-Dash Till Dawn

493 Joey Mercury (C 09) Ron Shalz KS $29,000
Feature Mr Jess-Dash To Glory

494  Scooter In Paris (C 06) Jay or Mary Lou Standefer NM $8,000
The Corona-Dash To Paris

495 Dashin For The Title (C 06) Withdrawn
Title Contender-Dashin Chiquita

496  Streakin Go Flight (C 06) Repurchase $14,500
Streakin La Jolla-Dashin N Breezin

497 Bedem (C 06) Repurchase $20,000

Brimmerton-Dashing Dion
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498  Streakin Brandon (C 06) Andrew T. Smith OK $22,000
Streakin La Jolla-Dashing Illusion

499 BP Southern Mariah (F 06) Withdrawn
Southern Cartel-Dashing Mariah

500 UC Perfection (F 06) Barbara D. Baer CA $6,000
Likenothinyoueversaw-Dashs Perfection

501 Rebel Woman (F 06) Clyde Peters TN $3,700
Special Leader-Dashy Ryon

502 Tell Em Cartel (C 06) Withdrawn
Corona Cartel-Dazzle Em Darling

503 De Elegant Blizzard (C 06) Tom Maher SD $6,200
This Snow Is Royal-De Elegant Dash

504 De Elegant Shazoom (C 06) Tom Maher SD $12,500
Shazoom-De Elegant Zevi

505 Bryens Eye Opener (C 06) Oscar Ramirez X $3,200
Mr Eye Opener-Debs Episode

506 Parish (C 06) Miguel A Carbajal TX $40,000
Mr Jess Perry-Deelish

507 Regal Delphia (F 06) Double T Ranch OK $17,000
A Regal Choice-Delphia

508 RK Fire Lord (C 06) David R. Myers SD $2,500
Sweet First Down-Derby Lord

509 Out There Somewhere (F 06) Jose Rodriguez X $9,000
Hawkinson-Design Express

510 Zoom For Fun (C 06) Pedro Alcala TX $18,500
Shazoom-Diamonds For Toni

511 Southern Brook (F 06) Mildred Fightmaster OK $10,000
Southern Cartel-Dianetomeetcha

512 Flamin And Easy (C 06) Roberto Valdez Perez MEX $6,200
Dashin Is Easy-Digging Flame N Amy

513 Jess Happy (C 06) No Bid $4,000
Jess Mr Perry-Digging For The Moon

514 Jess Do The Hustle (F 06) Jesus Guillermo Gonzalez Andrade MEX $34,000
Feature Mr Jess-Discos First Down

515 Divergent (C 06) Guerras Racing Stables X $17,000
Separatist-Dividends Declared

516 Ima Special Do Ya (F 06) Gerardo Luna X $12,000
Special Leader-Do Ya Dash

517 Dooleys Chivata (F 06) Dayna Bell MN $2,000

Dash To Chivato-Dooleys Lil Sister
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518 Pipers Tune (F 06) Repurchase $8,000
Bono Jazz-Dream Mirage

519 Streak Of Corona (C 06) Repurchase $4,500
Agouti-Dreamers Brat

520 Olecranon Lena (F 06) Darrell Ross OK $2,100
Olecranon-Ducka Lena

521 BP Southern Mary (F 06) Ivy Lane Racing Richard J Crispi CAN $8,000
Southern Cartel-Dianetomeetcha

522 Im Jess (C 06) Arbuckle Stables OK $15,000
Spit Curl Jess-Easter Mystery

523 Brimmertions Dashin (C 06) Repurchase $5,000
Brimmerton-Easy Date Dash

524 Her Ash (F 06) John Bassett AZ $52,000
Fishers Dash-Easy Henryetta

525 Dashing Joy Bug (F 06) Withdrawn
Dashing Val-Easy Joy Bug

526  BP Southern Susie (F 06) Randy Garrett KS $8,000
Southern Cartel-Easy Secret Sue

527 Donttakeforgranite (C 06) Oscar Ramirez X $1,800
Granite Lake-Easy Signature

528 IB Azoomer (C 06) Sam & Thurman Womack X $6,200
Azoom-Easy Sleazy

529 Like It And Enjoy It (F 06) Robert England AZ $5,500
Likenothinyoueversaw-Easy To Enjoy

530 Enough Gol (C 06) Joe H. Trett OK $2,500
Gol-Effort Enough

531 Remember The Shine (C 06) Ricardo Guerra X $6,500
First To Shine-Effort Remembered

532 Zoomin For Love (C 06) Jerry D. Chapman X $12,000
Shazoom-Effortless Love

533 Southernshootingstar (C 06) Gregg Sanders, Agent OK $2,600
Southern Cartel-Efforts Star

534 Mr Zoomer To You (C 06) Withdrawn
Shazoom-EJ Martha Feature

535 Miss Bedlan (F 06) Gary & Marlene McNichol CAN $5,000
Mr Eye Opener-Elainas Snowplow

536 TKO Sassy Zoom (F 06) Randy/Sandy Coleman TX $12,000
Shazoom-Elegant Winner

537 Sprint Copy (C 06) Abelino Rojas X $700

Kelly's Copy (TB)-Extra Hot Mama
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538 Eye On A Corona (C 06) Ramiro Villarreal, Agent MEX $58,000
Corona Cartel-Eye For The Sixes

539 Dancin Panther (C 06) Peter M. Spada CAN $1,700
Panther Mountain-Eye Opening Dancer

540 Coeur D Alene (F 06) Dan Moses KS $16,500
Stoli-Eye Opening Special

541 Miss Hempen Lil (F 06) Robert J. Touchet, Agent X $5,700
Takin On The Cash-Eyes R Special

542 Okey Dokey Dann (C 06) John Bassett AZ $14,000
Okey Dokey Dale-Eyesagone

543 Eyesa Shaken Tornado (C 06) Manny Silva & Baudelio Munoz IL $5,600
Royal Shake Em-Eyesonthelady

544 Reloaded And Ready (F 06) Double Eagle Ranch NM $85,000
Shazoom-Easy Henryetta

545 Corona For Jolie (F 06) Sam Howard & Sam Womack TX $13,500
Corona For Me-Fabulous Figure

546 Suspect Sadie (F 06) Withdrawn
Ausual Suspect-Fabulous Strawbaby

547 Cause Shes Special (F 06) Fernando De La Cruz X $12,000
Special Effort-Fanci Country Cash

548 Fantastic Closer (C 06) Gene L. & Margaret Mudd OK $14,000
Southern Cartel-Fantastic Polly

549 BP Jessies Fling (F 06) Double T Ranch OK $45,000
Mr Jess Perry-Frisco Fling

550 Mancer (C 06) Sergio Marquez TX $4,500
Eyesa Special-Fast Romance

551 RK Flyin Prospect (C 06) Rolando Alaniz X $2,800
Coronas Prospect-Fastest Flying Nanny

552 Panther Mountainette (F 06) Repurchase $9,500
Panther Mountain-Fastidious Fortune

553 Fearless Brick (F 06) C.W. Sherer OK $16,500
Brimmerton-Fearless Chick

554  Fearless Fritz (C 06) Rachuan Suarez MVZ MEX $23,000
Shazoom-Fearless Freda

555 Verdura (F 06) Salvador Pimienta, Agent AZ $23,000
Runaway Winner-Feet Down First

556 Lotsa Bang (C 06) V W P, Jr. Inc. OK $37,000
Tres Seis-Financial Help

557 First Down Zoom (C 06) Jesus Elsa Rojo CcoO $12,500

Shazoom-First A Princess
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558 Jazzi Appeal (F 06) Repurchase $3,500
Bono Jazz-First Appeal

559 First To Zoom (C 06) Denis Winn, Agent OK $5,200
Shazoom-First Down Delight

560 Eyesa Energy (C 06) Rusty Patterson TX $4,500
Eyesa Special-First Down Energy

561 Runners Luck (C 06) Jesus Guillermo Gonzalez Andrade MEX $15,000
Runaway Winner-First Dreamer

562  First Shazoom (C 06) * Jorge Leija TX $7,000
Shazoom-First On Ice

563 Calientes Wrangler (C 06) Efren Garcia MEX $10,000
Corona Caliente-First Place Affair

564 NCC Full Throttle (C 06) Max Torres AZ $7,500
Okey Dokey Dale-First Place Queen

565 First Place Eyesa (F 06) Withdrawn
Eyesa Special-First Place Style

566 Chiseled Gem (C 06) Doug McMullen X $6,200
SC Chiseled In Stone-First Rate Dial

567 Saving Faith (F 06) Withdrawn
Stoli-First Regards

568 Louisville Slugger (C 06) Saul Colin OK $5,000
Jess Louisiana Blue-First Smart Smash

569 Way Togo Flo (F 06) Salvador Pimienta, Agent AZ $37,000
Separatist-Florentine

570 Red Flag Warning (F 06) Repurchase $4,700
Brimmerton-Fly Your Flag

571 Flying To Holland (F 06) S/M Cattle Export Co. X $12,500
Holland Ease-Flying Legal

572 Premier Mr Perry (C 06) Repurchase $50,000
Mr Jess Perry-Flying Southbound

573 Jedice (C 06) Karina Jiminez OK $28,000
Mr Jess Perry-Fodice

574 Majestic Crest (C 06) Repurchase $30,000
Shazoom-Follys Dash

575 Southern Frisco (F 06) Repurchase $22,000
Southern Cartel-Frisco Fling

576 Word Of Truth (C 06) Jesus Avila/Jesus Cuevas/Apolinar Ri CA $12,200
Sixes Royal-First Regards

577 Fly The Red Eye (C 06) 0 Dan & Erin Knox X $22,000

Mr Eye Opener-Gaetana
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578 Granite Girl (F 06) Hector Fraire OK $4,700
Granite Lake-Gigis Girl

579 Call Me Ella (F 06) Repurchase $3,500
The Corona-Go Colours Go

580 Stolicious (C 06) Alberico Salinas X $11,500
Stoli-Go Dashing Nancy

581 A Special Prize (F 06) Ted Myers TN $4,700
Special Effort-Go First Lady

582 Sixarun Otoole (C 06) Bob McClure X $18,000
Jody O Toole-Going Sixty Six

583 Gold Czar (C 06) Vanessa Bartoo NM $16,000
Shazoom-Golden Form

584  First Special Shine (C 06) Ricardo Guerra X $6,500
First To Shine-Gone Special

585 KR Rockstar (C 06) Ruben Santos TX $3,000
Dash To Chivato-Goods Tiny Cat

586 Rightontheverge (F 06) Caison Farms X $10,000
Illegal Runaway-Halos

587 Like Always (F 06) Pete Scaramado TX $20,000
Hawkinson-Hasta Be Special

588 Bid A Shiney Jet (C 06) Abelino Rojas X $3,500
Biduino-Hasty Hannah

589 The Defibrillator (C 06) Jesus Salazar $22,000
Shazoom-Heart Trick

590 Heavenward Biduino (F 06) Ismael Lopez Gonzalez MEX $2,600
Biduino-Heavenward Bound

591 Eye Kick (F 06) Noel Lopez TX $13,500
Mr Eye Opener-Hiclass Girl

592 Jazzy Classy Miss (F 06) Christine Tavares CAN $7,800
Bono Jazz-High Bon Ton

593 Genuine Oaktree (C 06) James McArthur NM $40,000
Oak Tree Special-High Fashion Dash

594 Comendatore (C 06) Fletcher/Hickman/Pilgrim KS $12,000
A Regal Choice-Honey Who

595 Azoom With Ease (C 06) Withdrawn
Azoom-Honor Ease

596 Jessasweetheart (F 06) James Kelly AZ $8,200
Feature Mr Jess-Hot Blooded Wrangler

597 RF Make It Sixy (C 06) Ismael Lopez Gonzalez MEX $2,000

Make It Anywhere-How Sixy
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598 Starrz With Two Arrz (F 06) Rusty Carpenter OK $5,500
SC Chiseled In Stone-Hug A Memory

599 Sum Special Hum (F 06) Denny & Sandy Weigt 1D $8,000
Special Leader-Hummers Long Gone

600 Strap Hanger (C 06) Repurchase $4,500
Bono Jazz-Hurried Connection

601 Heza Hustlin Fast (C 06) Carol Smith-Casey X $3,500
Heza Fast Man-Hustle Hustle Hustle

602 Gotta Date To Win (F 06) Double T Ranch OK $12,700
Tres Seis-Hustle Your Bustle

603 Sweet Tobe Here (C 06) Richard D Nelson Cco $5,000
Sweet First Down-Hy Lucky Tobe Here

604 Spaced Out Corona (C 06) Rudy Ramirez OK $6,700
Coronas Prospect-Hyperspace

605 ICU Can Zoom (F 06) Randee Fagan TX $6,000
Shazoom-Icucanflytoo

606 Iknowicanopenmyeyes (C 06) Verle Bohner OK $4,500
Mr Eye Opener-Iknowican Iknowican

607 Ofishal (F 06) King Camden Running Horses, Inc. TX $47,000
Fishers Dash-Illusive Princess

608 CA Southern McCall (C 06) Repurchase $3,000
Southern Cartel-Illustrious Dash

609 A Silk Count (C 06) Double M Ranch X $3,500
Count Corona-Im Excited

610 BP Southern Alibi (C 06) Jose Garcia Lopez TX $16,000
Southern Cartel-Ima Ladys Alibi

611 Bubbles And Fizz (F 06) Javier Garcia $23,000
Mr Eye Opener-Ima Snow Runner

612 Jewels Miracle (F 06) Repurchase $10,000
Hawkinson-Ima Special Jewel

613 Indulgent Injun (F 06) Repurchase $20,000
Invisible Injun-Ima Task Also

614 Justa Zoomer (F 06) Marck Anthony OK $7,000
Shazoom-Indigo Special

615 Natalieonthebeach (F 06) Jo Baya Foreman LA $7,000
Jess Louisiana Blue-Injun On The Run

616 Streakin Intimate (F 06) Repurchase $1,200
Streakin Waddie-Intimate Encounter

617 Irish Cartel Lad (C 06) Ruben Santos TX $1,800

Cartel Dancer-Irish Sunset
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618 DM Dash Thru Traffic (C 06) Withdrawn
Dash Thru Traffic-Iscreamfordash

619 Brookhiser (F 06) David Brown OK $7,500
Brimmerton-Its High

620 Ima Smooth Cartel (C 06) Cesar J. Dabdoub AZ $9,500
Southern Cartel-Ima Ladys Alibi

621 Cartel Pride (C 06) Gene L. & Margaret Mudd OK $12,000
Southern Cartel-JA Codas Pride

622 Bobakanush (C 06) Withdrawn
Financial Rewards-JA Little Corona

623 Crackerjack Bully (C 06) Repurchase $5,000
Bully Bullion-Jackies Hempenetta

624 WSS Eyes Open (C 06) Repurchase $10,500
Mr Eye Opener-JC Simply Precious

625 Its The Vodka (C 06) Cody Bauserman OK $6,500
Stoli-JD Uhoh

626 Sixacash (F 06) Christine Tavares CAN $4,500
Streakin Sixes-Jennifer Cash

627 Jessshazoom (F 06) Christine Tavares CAN $14,500
Shazoom-Jessies Arrangement

628 Jesstifiably Quick (F 06) Larry Burch LA $4,000
Quick Coverage-Jesstifiable Debt

629 Jazzoom Azoom (F 06) Withdrawn
Azoom-Jitters Doll

630 Corona N Good (C 06) Ricardo Trevino Cantu MEX $7,500
The Corona-1JS Good N Gorgeous

631 ]JS Dark Wizzard (C 06) Withdrawn
Okey Dokey Dale-1JS Wicked Lady

632 JB Stardoc (C 06) Rachuan Suarez MVZ MEX $10,000
This Snow Is Royal-Joanies Alibi

633 Jody Dat Cash (C 06) Repurchase $7,500
Jody O Toole-Junomore

634 Feature Mr Gray Bar (C 06) Jesus Guillermo Gonzalez Andrade MEX $34,000

Feature Mr Jess-Just Mairi
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TOTAL SESSION TWO /YEARLING
Total Horses Sold = 240 $2,947,800.00 Average = $12,282.50
Total Repurchases = 49 $626,600.00 Average = $12,787.76
Total Transactions = 289 $3,574,400.00 Average = $12,368.17
Total Withdrawn = 27
Total No Bid =
Total No Sale = 0
Total Horses = 317
TOTAL THROUGH 2ND SESSION
Total Horses Sold = 485 $5,756,600.00 Average = $11,869.28
Total Repurchases = 95 $1,183,800.00 Average = $12,461.05
Total Transactions = 580 $6,940,400.00 Average = $11,966.21
Total Withdrawn = 52
Total No Bid = 2
Total No Sale = 0
Total Horses = 634
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